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Apartamento en Casares – 2 habitaciones – 1 baños

Hab. 2 Bathrooms 1 Const. 90m2 Terraza 23m2

R4402258 property Casares 299.000€

Discover Your Dream Seaside Retreat in Casares, Manilva! Are you ready to wake up every 
morning to the soothing sound of waves and the breathtaking panorama of the sea? Look no further! 
We present to you an exquisite 2-bedroom, 1-sea apartment that promises to redefine coastal living. 
Mesmerizing Sea Views: Imagine sipping your morning coffee while gazing at the endless horizon of 
the Mediterranean Sea. Every day will feel like a vacation as you bask in the beauty of 
nature&apos;s masterpiece. Your Own Outdoor Oasis: This apartment is truly a haven for nature 
lovers. With not one, not two, but four outdoor spaces, you&apos;ll have plenty of room to soak up 
the sun and relish the fresh sea breeze. The rear garden offers a tranquil escape surrounded by lush 
greenery, while the front terrace is perfect for al fresco dining with a view. The lower terrace provides 
an intimate setting for relaxation, and convenient parking ensures you&apos;re never far from home. 
Dive into Serenity: The joys of coastal living extend beyond the apartment itself. Immerse yourself in 
the blissful experience of a community pool and meticulously maintained gardens. Whether 
you&apos;re looking to cool off on a sunny day or take a leisurely stroll among blooming flowers, the 
options are endless. Affordable Luxury: Can you believe all of this comes at a cost of just €100 per 
month? Yes, you read that right! Indulge in a lifestyle of comfort, tranquility, and convenience without 
breaking the bank. And if you&apos;re looking for a long-term investment, this gem can be yours for 
only €300,000. Prime Location: Situated in the charming town of Manilva, you&apos;ll have the best 
of both worlds – a peaceful retreat and easy access to local amenities, shops, and dining options. 
Your New Chapter Awaits: Don&apos;t miss out on this opportunity to own your slice of paradise. 
This 2-bed, 1-sea apartment is more than just a property; it&apos;s a promise of a life well-lived. 
Contact us today to schedule a viewing and embark on a journey towards a new beginning.
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