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House in Alhaurín de la Torre – 3 bedrooms – 4 baths

Bedrooms 3 Bathrooms 4 Built 187m2 Plot 0m2

R4967818 property Alhaurín de la Torre 475.000€



Exquisite Corner Townhouse on Prestigious Lauro Golf Course Welcome to your dream home 
nestled within the serene landscapes of Lauro Golf, where luxury meets comfort in this stunning 
corner townhouse. This beautifully reformed residence is not just a home; it’s a lifestyle choice for 
those who appreciate elegance and tranquility. As you enter this magnificent property, you are 
greeted by a spacious hallway that leads to a stylish guest bathroom, setting the tone for the rest of 
the home. The heart of this townhouse is undoubtedly its beautiful open kitchen, fully equipped with 
top-of-the-line appliances that will inspire your culinary adventures. The seamless flow from the 
kitchen to the inviting lounge creates an ideal space for entertaining friends and family. Picture cozy 
evenings by the fireplace, or step outside through the lounge doors to your private terrace—perfect 
for al fresco dining or simply soaking up the sun. Ascend to the first floor where you’ll discover a 
luxurious master bedroom suite featuring an ensuite bathroom complete with a relaxing bathtub and 
an expansive walk-in shower. Enjoy morning coffee on your own terrace while taking in breathtaking 
views of the lush golf course. A second well-appointed bedroom with its own ensuite bathroom 
provides privacy and comfort for guests or family members. The second floor unveils yet another 
gem—a generously sized bedroom (with bathroom ensuite) boasting two terraces, one of which 
features a soothing jacuzzi, perfect for unwinding after a long day or entertaining under starlit skies. 
Every inch of this townhouse has been thoughtfully designed to offer modern living at its finest. 
Additional highlights include an underground garage and storage space, ensuring convenience and 
security for all your belongings. This property is truly move-in ready—just bring your personal touch! 
Don’t miss out on this rare opportunity to own a piece of paradise on Lauro Golf Course! Schedule 
your private viewing today and experience firsthand what makes this corner townhouse so special. 
Your luxurious lifestyle awaits!

Covered Terrace Covered Terrace Double Glazing

Ensuite Bathroom Fiber Optic Fitted Wardrobes

Jacuzzi Marble Flooring Paddle Tennis

Private Terrace Restaurant On Site Solarium

Storage Room
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